
ORDINANCE NO. 1044

2015 International Residential Code

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF CANYON, TEXAS:
AMENDING THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF CANYON, CHAPTER
I5O, SECTION 150.24, TO RESCIND TIJE 2OI2 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL
CODE; ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE; MAKING
CERTAIN AMENDMENTS THERETO; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY;
PROVIDING FOR REPEALER; PROVIDING A PENALTY; PROVIDING FOR
PUBLICATION AND EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, upon the recommendation of the Construction Advisory and Appeals Board, the
City Commission now finds it is in the best interest of the public health, safety, and welfare to
adopt the 2015 International Residential Code, published by the International Code Council, with
certain amendments.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF
CANYON, TEXAS:

SECTION l. That Chapter 150, Section 150.24 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 2. That Chapter 150, Section 150.24 is hereby re-adopted, as amended, to read as

follows:

Section 150.24. Adoption of International Residential Code: amendments.

International Residential Code adopted. This section is applicable to all structures within the
City described herein as one and two family dwellings and townhouses not more than three (3)
stories in height. Accordingly, there is hereby adopted the International Residential Code,2015
Edition, as published by the International Code Council, excluding Part VIII Electrical (Chapters
34-43), and including Appendix J, with the following amendments, copies of which shall be
maintained by the Building Official.

R101.1 Title. Insert: Citlr of Canvon

R104.12 Contractor Reeistration. The Buildine Official shall receive applications from and
register contractors according to the rules adopted by the City in Section 150.23 of the Code of
Ordinances.

R105.1 Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, alter,
repair, move, demolish or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to erect, install,
enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing
system, the installation of which is regulated by this code, or to cause any such work to be done,
shall first make application to the building official and obtain the required permit prior to start of
demolition or construction activity.

Building permits issued to either registered contractors" or Homeowners. Building permits for
construction of. alterations of, or additions to buildings and structures shall onllz be issued to

1.



either:
1. A residential buildine contractor registered in accordance with Section 150.23 of the Code

of Ordinances. or
2. A Homeowner. for work to be done on his propertlz. when the Homeowner is acting as his

own building contractor in accordance with the homeowner exemption in Section 150.23.

R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Permits shall not be required for the following. Exemption
from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to
be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances
of this jurisdiction.

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and
similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square feet ( 18.58 m2).

2. Fences not over 8 feet (2438mm) high.
3. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from top of the

wall to the lowest adjacent grade, unless supporting a surcharge.
4. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons

(18,927L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 7.

5. Sidewalks and driveways.
6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.
7. Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep.

8. Swings and other playground equipment.
9. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54 inches

(1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.
10. Decks not exceeding 200 square feet (18.58m2) in area, that are not more than 30 inches

(762 mm) above grade at any point, are not attached to a dwelling and do not serve the
exit door required by Section R31 1.4.

R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical and
plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as

reouired. in accordance with the schedule of fees in in Section 150.23 of the Code of Ordinances.

R108.3 Building permit valuations. Building permit valuation shall include total value of the
work for which a permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing equipment
and other permanent systems, including materials and labor. Final building permit valuation shall
be set blr the building official in accordance with the most current Building Valuation Data as

published by the lnternational Code Council or approved statements sufficient to clearly
document all construction costs.

R108.5 Refunds. Fee refunds shall be made in accordance with Section 150.23 of the Code of
Ordinances.

R112 Construction Advisor), and Anpeals Board. See Section 150.20 of the Code of
Ordinances.

2



Table R301.2.(1) amended as follows:

ABLE R301. A D
GROUND

SNOW

LOAD

WIND DESIGN SEISMIC
DESIGN

CATERGORY

SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM WINTER
DESIGN

TEI/P

ICE BARRIER

UNDERLAYERMENT

REQUIRED

FLOOD

HAZARD

AIR
FREEZING

INDEX

I\,IEAN

ANNUAL

TEMPSpeed
Topographic

effects

Special wind

debris zone

Wind-borne

debris zone
Weathering

Frost line
denth

Termite

29p.1 I I Cmph NO NO NO B lvloderate 18"
l\,,loderate

200 NO Chao 1 53 311 51.20

R301.2 (T) CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

R302.1 Exterior walls: Exceptions: Add exception item 6 as follows:

6. Zero lot line structures platted in accordance with the City of Canvon Zoning Ordinance.
The following specific provisions shall appl)r:

6.1 Exterior wall finish shall be brick veneer. masonry units or other approved
materials.

6.2 Soffrt material shall be of approved material.
6.3 Roof ventilation openings not permitted underside of soffit.
6.4 Plumbing cleanout allowed when required.
6. 5 Allowance of openings constructed of masonry unit glass: single opening maximum

9 square feet or up to three (3) openings: each a maximum of 4 square feet. spaced

minimum 24 inches apart.

R310.1 Emergency escape and rescue opening required. Exception: Storm shelters and

basements used only to house mechanical equipment and not exceeding total floor area of 400
square feet (37.16m2).

Section R313: Delete the entire section.

R315.2.2 Alterations, repairs and additions. Where alterations, repairs or additions requiring
a permit occur, or where one or more sleeping rooms are added or created in existing dwellings,
the individual dwelling unit shall be equipped with carbon monoxide alarms located as required
for new dwellings.
Exceptions:

1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as the addition of a porch or
deck, are exempt from the requirements of this section.

2. Installation, alteration or repairs of plumbing systems when all such work occurs on the

exterior of dwellings. such as water or sewer lines. or lawn irrigation systems are exempt
from the requirements of this section.

R3f 53 Location. Carbon monoxide alarms in dwelling units shall be installed outside of each

separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms. Where a fuel-buming appliance
is located within a bedroom or its attached bathroom, a carbon monoxide alarm shall be installed

within the bedroom. Approved alarms shall be installed in accordance with manufacturers'

installation instructions or located on the wall or ceiling at a heieht 42 inches above floor.
avoiding locations near heating/cooline vents or areas which provide turbulent airflow. and

minimum 36 inches away from openinqs to areas of high humidity. Avoid installing CO alarms
in kitchens or above fuel-burning aopliances.

R319.1 Address identification. Buildings shall be provided with approved address

identification. The address identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible
from the street or road fronting the property. Address identihcation characters shall contrast with

3



their background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers
shall be spelled out. Each character shall be not less than 4 inches (102mm) in height with a

stroke width of not less than 0.5 inch (l2.7mm). Where required by the buildine official, address

identification shall be provided in additional approved locations facilitate emergency response.

Where access is by means of a private road and the building address cannot be viewed from the
public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure.

Address identification shall be maintained.

R322 Flood-Resistant Construction. is hereby deleted with the exception of 322.1.1, which is
hereby amended as follows:

322.1General. All structures constructed within a Special Flood Hazard area as designated

blr Chapter 153. Flood Damage Prevention. of the Code of Ordinances shall comply with
Chapter 153 and other applicable sections of this code.

R401.2 Requirements. Foundation construction shall be capable of accommodating all loads

according to Section R30t and of transmitting the resulting loads to the supporting soil. Fill soils

that support footings and foundations shall be designed, installed and tested in accordance with
accepted engineering practice. Gravel fill used as footings for wood and precast concrete

foundations shall comply with Section R403. Concrete foundations will be desipned by
registered design professional licensed in the State of Texas or constructed in compliance with
The 2015 Panhandle Residential Foundation Manual.

R404.4 Retaining walls. Is hereby amended by adding the following sentence:

Retaining walls measuring more than 48" fr,om the top of the wall to the lowest adjacent erade.

and retaining walls bearing a surcharee. or impoundine Class I. II. or III-A liquids shall be

designed by a Texas licensed professional engineer.

R405.1 Concrete or masonry foundations. Drains shall be provided around all concrete or

masonry foundations that retain earth and enclose habitable or usable spaces located below
grade. Drainage tiles, gravel or crushed stone drains, perforated pipe or other approved systems

or materials shall be installed at or below the area to be protected and shall discharge by gravity
or mechanical means into an approved drainage system. Gravel or crushed stone drains shall

extend at least 1 foot (305 mm) beyond the outside edge of the footing and 6 inches (152 mm)

above the top of the footing and be covered with an approved filter membrane material. The top

of open joints of drain tiles shall be protected with strips of building paper. Perforated drains

shall be surrounded with an approved filter membrane or the filter membrane shall cover the

washed gravel or crushed rock covering the drain. Drainage tiles or perforated pipe shall be

placed on a minimum of 2 inches (5lmm) of washed gravel or crushed rock at least one sieve

size larger than the tile joint opening or perforation and covered with not less than 6 inches (152

mm) of the same material.

Exception: A drainage system is not required when the foundation is installed on well-
drained ground or sand-gravel mixture soils according to the Unified Soil Classification
System, Group I Soils, as detailed in Table R405.1 or constructed in accordance with the

20 1 5 Panhandle Residential Foundation Manual.

905.7.1Deck requirements. Wood shingles shall be installed only on solid sheathing.



R905.8.1 Deck requirements. Wood shakes shall be used only on solid sheathing.

Table R905.8.5 amended as follows:

TS

R908.1 General. Materials and methods of application used for re-covering or replacing and

existing roof covering shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 9, including but not limited
to decking. flashing. and ventilation.

R908.3.1.1 Re-covering versus replacement. New roof coverings shall not be installed without
first removing existing roof coverings where any of the following conditions occur:

1. Where the existing roof or roof covering is water-soaked or has deteriorated to the point

that the existing roof or roof covering is not adequate as a base for additional roofing.
2. Where the existing roof covering is wood, slate, clay, cement or asbestos-cement tile.

3. Where the existing roof has two or more applications of any type of roof covering.

4. For asphalt shingles" when the building is located in an area subject to moderate or severe

hail exposure according to Figure R908.3.1.1.

ABLE R905.8.5 WOOD SHAKE MATERIAL REOUIREMI,N

MATERIAL

MINIMUM
GRADES APPLICABLE GRADING RULES

Wood shakes of naturally durable wood I Cedar Shake and Shinele Bureau

Taper sawn shakes and shingles of naturally durable
wood I Cedar Shake and Shingle Bureau

Preservative-treated shakes and shingles of naturally
durable wood

I Cedar Shake and Shingle Bureau

Fire-retardant-treated shakes of naturally durable
wood

I Cedar Shake and Shingle Bureau

Preservative-treated taper sawn shakes of Southern
pine treated in accordance with AWPA Standard Ul
(Commodity Specification A, Use Category 38 and

section 5.6)

I or2 Forest Products Laboratory of the Texas
Forest Services

5



FIGURE 908.3.1.1 HAIL EXPOSURE MAP

.J

TABLE Nl 102.1.2 (R402.1.2)
INSULA ON AND FENESTRATION RE

CLIMATE
ZONE

FENESTRATION
U-FACTORb

SKYLICHTb
U-FACTOR

GLAZED
FENESTRATION

SHGCb."

CEILING
R-VALUE

WOOD
FRAME WALL

R.VALUE

MASS
WALL

R-VALUE'

FLOOR
R-VALUE

BASEMENT"
WALL

R-VALUE

SLABd
R-VALUE
& DEPTH

CRAWL
SPACE"
WALL

R-VALUE

I NR 0.7 5 0.2s 30 l3 34 t3 0 0 0

2 0.40 0.65 0.25 38 l3 46 l3 0 0 0

3 0.35 0.55 0.25 38 20or13+5h 81 13 l9 5rl 3 0 5il 3

4
except Marine

0.35 0.55 0.40 ,10 l5or13+lh 8,',13 l9 10,1 3 5. 12 in. l0i l3

5 and
Marine 4

0.-11 0.55 NR 19 20or13-5h 13, l7 -108 15 l9 10.2ft l5 l9

6 0.32 0.55 NR 49 20+5or13+lOh 15 20 308 l5r l9 10.4ft I 5il9

7and8 0.32 0.55 NR 49 20+5or13+10h l912l 38c l5il9 10.4 ft l5il9

Footnotes shall remain unchanged.

MENTS BY COMPONENT"

6



TABLE Nl 102.1.4 (R402.1.4)
UIVALENT U-FACTORS"

Climate Zone
Fenestration U-

Factor
Skylight U-

Factor
Ceiling U-

Factor
Frame Wall U-

Factor
Mass Wall U-

Factor
Floor U-
Factor

Basement Wall
U-Factor

Crawl Space
Wall U-Factor

I 0.50 0.7 5 0.035 0.084 0.197 0.064 0.360 0.47'l

2 0.40 0.65 0.030 0.084 0.r65 0.064 0.360 0.477

J 0.35 0.55 0.030 0.060 0.098 0.047 0.09 lc 0.1 36

4 except
Marine 0.35 0.55 0.28 0.070 0.098 0.047 0.059 0.065

5 and Marine
4 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.060 0.082 0.033 0.059 0.05s

6 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.045 0.060 0.033 0.0s0 0.055

7and8 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.045 0.057 0.028 0.050 0.055

Footnotes shall remain unchanged.

Nl102.2.1 (R402.2.1) Ceilings with attic space. Where Section N1102.1.2 would require R-40
in the ceiling, R-30 over 100 percent of the ceiling area requiring insulation shall be deemed to
satisfy the requirement for R-40 wherever the full height of uncompressed R-30 insulation
extends over the wall top plate at the eaves. This reduction shall not apply to the U-factor
alternative approach in Section N1102.1 .4 and the total UA alternative in Section N1102.1.5.

Nl103.3.3 (R403.3.3) Duct testing (Mandatory). Ducts shall be pressure tested to determine
air leakage by one of the following methods:

1. Rough-in test: Total leakage shall be measured with a pressure differential of 0.1 inches

w.g. (25 Pa) across the system, including the manufacturer's air handler enclosure if
installed at the time of the test. All registers shall be taped or otherwise sealed during the

test.

2. Postconstruction test: Total leakage shall be measured with a pressure differential of 0.1

inches w.g. (25 Pa) across the entire system, including the manufacturer's air handler

enclosure. All register boots shall be taped or otherwise sealed during the test.

Exception: A duct air leakage test shall not be required where the ducts and air handlers

are located entirely within the building thermal envelope.

Duct testing to be done blz a company/person who is certified by a recognized accreditation
organization and their equipment be recertified on an annual basis. Contractors who choose

not to attain the required certification or use the proper testing tools will be required to

ensase the services ofa certified tester.

A written report of the results of the test hall be signed by the party conducting the test and
provided to the code official.

N{l4ll.4 Condensate Pumps. Condensate pumps located in uninhabitable space, such as attics

and crawl spaces, shall be connected to the appliance or equipment served such that when the
pump fails, the appliance or equipment will be prevented from operating. Pumps shall be

7



installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions and shall not prevent the operation
of fuel fired appliances.

M1411.5 Auxiliary drain line. Category IV condensing appliances shall have an auxiliary drain
pan where damage to any building component will occur as a result of stoppage in the
condensate drainage system or failure of a condensate pump. These pans shall be installed in
accordance with the applicable provisions of section M141 1.3.1 item (1.) and be provided under
condensate pumps.

P2503.6 Shower liner test. Where shower floors and receptors are made water tight by the
application of materials required by Section P2709.2, the completed liner installation shall be
tested prior to the installation of the shower floor covering. The pipe from the shower drain shall
be plugged water tight for the test. The floor and receptor area shall be filled with potable water
to a depth of not less than 2 inches (5lmm) measured at the threshold. Where a threshold of not
less than 2 inches (5lmm) in height does not exist, a temporary threshold shall be constructed to
retain the test water in the lined floor or receptor area to a level not less than 2 inches (5 I mm) in
depth measured at the threshold. The water shall be retained for a test period of not less than 15

minutes and there shall not be evidence of leakage.

P2603.5.1 Sewer depth. Insert: 12 inches.

Table P3002.1(1) Above-Ground Drainage and Vent Pipe. Cellular core is hereby deleted
from the table.

Table P3002.1(2) Underground Building Drainage and Vent Pipe. Cellular core is hereby
deleted from the table.

Table P3002.2 Building Sewer Pipe. Cellular core is hereby deleted from the table.

Part VIU - ELECTRICAL. Delete in its entiretlz. S.B. 365 Sec. 214.213 (adoption 2014 NEC
w/amendments)

Appendix J Existing Building and Structures. Appendix J. Existing Buildings and Structures.
is hereby adopted.

Appendix K Sound Transmission. Appendix K. Sound Transmission. is hereby adopted.

SECTION 3. Severability. If any provision, section, subsection, sentence, clause, or the
application of the same to any person or set of circumstances for any reason is held to be
unconstitutional, void or invalid or for any reason unenforceable, the validity of the remaining
portions of this ordinance or the application thereby shall remain in effect, it being the intent of
the City Commission of the City of Canyon, Texas in adopting this ordinance, that no portion
thereof or provision contained herein shall become inoperative or fail by any reasons of
unconstitutionality of any other portion or provision.

SECTION 4. Repealer. All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance
are hereby repealed to the extent of conflict with this ordinance.

8



SECTION 5. Penalty. It is an offense to violate any part of this ordinance, punishable upon
conviction in accordance with Section 150.99 of the City of Canyon Code of Ordnances.

SECTION 6. Publishing and Effective Date. This ordinance shall be published according to law
and become effective November 1,2016.

ATTEST:


